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Allscripts Sunrise™ Earns Top Spot for Large Hospitals and Academic Medical Centers

LAS VEGAS, March 01, 2016 (GLOBE NEWSWIRE) -- Black Book Rankings™ named Allscripts (NASDAQ:MDRX) Sunrise platform as the top overall
inpatient electronic health record (EHR) for large hospitals and academic medical centers for the third consecutive year.

Allscripts also achieved recognition as one of the top vendors for client loyalty in Black Book’s HIT Loyalty Index, which is a framework for measuring
loyalty and stability of a vendor’s customer base.

Nearly 2,200 qualified users of EHR systems, representing 622 hospitals, ranked vendors through a Black Book Rankings survey in Q4 2015.
According to Black Book Rankings, it does not rely on vendors’ client lists as source data.

“Allscripts is honored to be named a market leader by Black Book for the third year in a row,” said Paul Black, Allscripts Chief Executive Officer. “It is a
testament to the outcomes our clients have achieved using Sunrise to provide complex care for their patients. This recognition reaffirms that Sunrise is
the best integrated clinical and financial EHR for hospitals that need an Open, interoperable solution that enables innovation.”

Allscripts Sunrise EHR platform is an integrated suite of solutions for acute, post-acute, ambulatory, revenue cycle and emergency healthcare
providers. Solutions include a single EHR for emergency, inpatient and ambulatory care settings, as well as a patient portal. Allscripts Sunrise also
provides access to integrated patient information across care settings and community organizations and offers clinical decision support that can lead
to improved outcomes. It is the world’s only true community-aware EHR capable of integrating genomic data.

“Congratulations to Allscripts for once again taking the top spot in the annual Black Book rankings,” said Doug Brown, Managing Partner and
President, Black Book. “The survey findings make it clear that Allscripts is committed to ensuring client success and fostering long-term relationship
with clients.”

“Northwell Health has remained loyal to Allscripts since deploying our first Allscripts solution because of the strong partnership our teams have
developed, which focuses on clinician satisfaction, patient engagement and driving outcomes across our health system,” said John Bosco, CIO,
Northwell Health. “We’re proud to see that one of our trusted partners is recognized once again by Black Book.”

Black Book methodology is crowd sourced and represents a broad spectrum of EHR users. For more information, visit
www.blackbookmarketresearch.com.

About Black Book™

Black Book Rankings, a division of Black Book Market Research LLC, provides comprehensive comparison data of the healthcare industry's most
respected and competitively performing technology vendors. The largest user opinion poll of its kind in healthcare IT, Black Book collects more than
450,000 viewpoints on information technology and outsourced services vendor performance annually. Black Book was founded in 2000, is
internationally recognized for over 15 years of customer satisfaction polling, particularly in technology, services, outsourcing and offshoring industries.
Black Book, its owners nor its employees holds any financial interest in the companies contained in its comparison performance report and is not
incentivized to recommend any particular vendor.

About Allscripts

Allscripts (NASDAQ:MDRX) is a leader in healthcare information technology solutions that advance clinical, financial and operational results. Our
innovative solutions connect people, places and data across an Open, Connected Community of Health™. Connectivity empowers caregivers to make
better decisions and deliver better care for healthier populations. To learn more, visit www.allscripts.com, Twitter, YouTube and It Takes A Community:
The Allscripts Blog.
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